
 Greetings from Hampshire Learning Grid 
 
Create a leaflet showing the 
top sites to visit in 
Hampshire.   

Complete some different 
walks around Hampshire and 
make evaluations about 
which walks you enjoyed and 
the reasons why.  

Label a map of Hampshire as 
you learn about different 
towns and cities in 
Hampshire.  

Research some famous 
people from Hampshire and 
explore the impact that they 
have had on Hampshire. 

Create a sequence of moves 
that could be used as a 
Maypole dance. 

Research the Flag of 
Hampshire and explain the 
symbolism used. 

Create a fact page about 
Hampshire. 

Compare different styles of 
architecture around 
Hampshire.  Design your own 
architecture which you think 
will fit in with the styles of 
Hampshire. 

Research the different 

populations of town and 

cities.  What impact do you 

think these populations will 

have on Hampshire?   

Design a collage of different 
places in Hampshire that 
would attract tourist to the 
area.  

Investigate what food is 
Hampshire known for.  Cook 
a meal that is traditional in 
Hampshire.  

Investigate the different 
weather data around 
Hampshire.  Which town or 
city do you think is best in 
terms of the climate? 

Design a poster to highlight 
an environmental issue in 
Hampshire that you would 
like to highlight e.g. road 
traffic speeds, litter pollution. 

On a walk around Alton and 
Holybourne take photographs 
of landscapes that you would 
like to draw and paint.   

Think of ways that you could 
help in your local area.  Share 
how you have been a 
responsible community 
member.  

Develop a quiz about 
Hampshire. 

 


